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. COMBINER BOX

Collects multiple
strings of PV
modules and
combines them
in parallel

SOLAR
BREAKER(S)

Switch on the Main
Service Panel that
cuts the power
coming from

your array

) INVERTER

Converts the DC
power coming from
your darray to AC
power before it
reaches your home

6 ETHERNET

Hardwired internet
connection cable,
likely located near
computer
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3 ACDISCONNECT

Safety feature to
cut AC power
before it reaches
Main Service Panel

ROUTER

Wireless internet
connection device,
likely located near
computer

4 MAIN SERVICE

PANEL

Controls power
from the grid and
your array to the
individual circuits
of your home

8 METER

Device that reads
incoming and
outgoing power to
and from the grid
and your home
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Before getting started with troubleshooting, it is helpful to know what your
Envoy will look and how you’ll know when it’s successfully connected.

The LED/Buttons panel may be arran
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ged differently based on the Envoy model you have.
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When your IQ Combiner has successfully connected, the
left-most LED light will be solid green.

The buttons will be arranged horizontally.

When your Envoy Sor I1Q
Envoy has successfully
connected, the top LED
light will be solid green.

The buttons will be
arranged vertically.
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LED indicators on the Envoy S and IQ Envoy

@ ENLIGHTEN COMMUNICATION LED
s Green when connected to Enphase’s Enlighten cloud
Em mm == Flashing green when Envoy is attempting to connect to Enlighten
s Solid amber when connected to local network only i.e., no internet

Off if no network is available

AP MODE LED (WI-FI)

This LED will only be lit if your Envoy is connected to the internet via Wi-Fi. If your
Envoy is connected to the internet in a different way (such as ethernet or cellular
connection), this LED will not be lit.

I Green when AP mode is enabled and Envoy Wi-Fi network connected

Off when AP mode is turned off

@ AP MODE BUTTON

This is only used by the installer during installation or to configure the system
Stats Envoy’s wireless Access Point (AP) to connect to a mobile phone directly.

@ POWER PRODUCTION LED

This usually appears amber at dawn/dusk, off at night, and flashing amber after
Envoy restarts.

Emmsmsmmmmm Green When all microinverters are producing power

W= == wmm Flashing green when an upgrade of the microinverters is in progress
Emmmssmmmmmm  Amber if one or more microinverters stop producing power

mm mm == Flashing amber when microinverters are not yet detected

Off if all the microinverters stop producing or communicating

SERVICE DEPARTMENT
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@ DEVICE COMMUNICATION LED

This is usually amber during dawn/dusk and off at night.

Immsmmmm—— Green when all provisioned microinverters are communicating with Envoy
Em mm == Flashing green when Envoy is scanning for microinverters
Emmmmmmmmm Amber if one or more microinverters are not communicating with Envoy

Off if all microinverters are not communicating with Envoy

@ DEVICE SCAN BUTTON

Only used by installer during installation or to configure the system.
Starts/stops a 15-minute scan for devices over the power line.

ALLLED’'S

m= mm = Flashing green when software upgrade is in progress

BE mm == Flashing amber when IQ Envoy is booting up

SERVICE DEPARTMENT
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Are you seeing a system error notice in your Enlighten App?

@ system Errar < s
07 Jul 2027 (D65
» “Envoy Not Reporting”
F Few L JILL
Latest Power Peak Power o "Microinverter(s)
Not Reporting”
PAA
#%¢ Energy Produced
0.1 kwh 45,4 kwh 0.0kwh
July 07, 2021 July 06, 2021 July 07, 2020

How to fix an “Envoy Not Reporting” system error message?

Make sure your Envoy has power.
@ Envoy Not Reporting

Ste 'Io . Your system hasn't reported data to Enlighten since
p d Open the AC Combiner box and Apr 27,2021 Is your internet connection down?

look for the LEDs. Click here for help.

Step 2: if none of the LEDs on your Envoy
are lit, the Envoy is not receiving power. Turn
off and on the breaker feeding your IQ Combiner or unplug and plug back in the device.

Step 3: If after turning the breaker feeding the Envoy off and on the LEDs are still not lit,
please contact the Service Department for further assistance.
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Make sure your Envoy has internet connection.

Step l: Confirm that the internet is working properly in your home/building. If not, please
contact your Internet Service Provider to help re-establish an internet connection.

SteP 2: Determine which of the following ways your Envoy is connected to the internet
and follow the provided guidance. If you are not sure about how your Envoy is connected to
the Enphase Enlighten monitoring portal, please see INTERNET CONNECTION (PG 9).

Ethernet connection:

If your Envoy has a hardline internet ethernet connection — meaning
that there is an ethernet cable running from your Envoy to your router -
confirm that the ethernet cable is fully plugged into your Envoy, as well
as into your router.

Confirm that your router is plugged into an electrical outlet.

Cellular connection/cell-card connection:

Locate your Multi-Tech cellular modem. Your Multi-Tech cellular modem
may be a standalone unit inside your home, but it is more likely mounted
inside an enclosure like the AC Combiner box, along with your Envoy.

Unplug the USB cable from the Envoy.

If your cellular modem is connected with a Y-cable, disconnect both USB connectors. (It does
not matter which connector goes into which USB port.)
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Power the Envoy off and then on by unplugging and re-plugging the power
cord. If your Envoy does not have a power cord, you can power the Envoy off
and on by flipping the Envoy’s circuit breaker open and then closing again.

HOIH

Confirm that the modem antenna is oriented vertically.

Reconnect the USB cable to the Envoy. This will power up the modem and
cause it to join the cellular network.

Wireless /[Wi-Fi connection:

Reconnect using the Enphase Enlighten App (mobile app) — See RECONNECT
TO WI-FI USING APP (PG 10)

Reconnect via manual Wi-Fi setup — See RECONNECT TO WI-FI MANUALLY (PG 14)

Why can’t | see my production data even after my Envoy has been
reconnected to the internet?

Don’t worry if you don’t see your production data on the portal - or if the top/left-most light
of the Envoy is red - even after reconnecting your Envoy back to the internet. It takes some
time for the backed-up data to sync up with Enlighten. Typically, it takes about 1 hour for
each day of your Envoy being offline. For example, if your Envoy was offline for 30 days your
system should fully sync up in about 30 hours.

If there is still a connectivity challenge after performing these troubleshooting steps, please
reach out to the Service Department for additional assistance.
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How to fix a “Microinverter(s) Not Reporting” system error message?

Step 12 if only 1-2 of the microinverters

are not reporting, it could be that the (D Microinverters Not Reporting
microinverter needs an update from No microinverters are reporting data to the
Enphase or has failed. Contact the Service Envoy. Where's the problem?

Department for additional assistance.

Step lIb: If more than half to all of the microinverters are not reporting, navigate to the
breakers feeding your Envoy. Turn breakers off and on.

Step 2: Check that the AC disconnect - outside by your electric meter -has its handle
in the up/ON position.

If these steps do not help the microinverters to report normally, contact the Service
Department for additional assistance.

SERVICE DEPARTMENT
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You can see how your Envoy is connected to the internet by
accessing your Enlighten account mobile app and following
the steps below:

e e _

© syere =
B 17.Jun 2021 it et £ Site Details

$0.7% $5.0%
Latest Pow P
&

System Account

se
$5# Energy Produced

P | Bt | S8 < 2

Settings Support
395 ) ¢ @JJN-:ths 5 E Connection Type : Ethernet
E;piore Community T
(M Logout
= ENPHASE
H = =
Step 1 select the Step 2: scroll down Step 3: Open site
“Menu” option from to the option “System”, Details and note the
the MyEnlighten then select “Site type of connection
Overview pane. Details” from the in use.

drop-down.
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Reconnecting your Envoy S or IQ Envoy via Wi-Fi using Enphase
Enlighten App

all Airtel = 3 100%

941

( 9:41

Hello, W L Notices
2 ENPHASE - | <

Latest Status T b
st updted | our 50 G Site |D: (» Envoy is Not Reporting

® System Normal

We have found that your using Envoy -S or 1Q

¥ 2.03% X EB @ Envoy and using Wi-Fi.

Latest Power ek Powe Storage System Account |,Ge(,y,our,Envoy,,connected,back,(o,Home,Wi;Ei

&

6.9 win 1.98 .

Imported Discharged Settings Support FOIEBOXO® ® Qo 5% 819:32
L

11L
®o.854 Ll il @

24,54 .
Cansumed Refer Friends Explore

Net Imported

o ﬁ @ 1Q Envoy
= 7 Sorii SN: 121843033941
ommunity ervices S LG AN 0
2.54 \
Charged Connected to Enlighten
@ App Information > Connect Locally >
Configure Wi-Fi
(-I) Logout To change Envoy internet connectivity 2

Step 1: open the Step 2: select “Notices”, “Get your Envoy
Enphase Enlighten App ~ connected back to Home Wi-Fi”, “Configure Wi-Fi".
on your iOS or Android

mobile device and tap

on the “Menu” tab at the

bottom of the screen.

Step 3: Bring your phone into the Wi-Fi range of Envoy and follow the steps
mentioned on the “Reconnect to Envoy” page in your Enphase Enlighten App.
For your reference, the steps to follow have also been elaborated below:
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Step 3a: Press the AP mode button. Do not hold, but just briefly
press and release the Envoy menu button. This will enable AP
mode (access point mode) on your Envoy which creates a
wireless network you can join with your smartphone.

Note: If you see a solid green LED next
to the Cell phone icon, it means, AP

£ Reconnect to Envoy

e e mode is successfully enabled, you may
re-cennect your Envoy.
proceed to the next step.

We have found that you are using Envoy-S or I1Q Envoy
and using Wi-Fi

Follow the below steps to reconnect :

If the AP mode LED next to the cell
° T,Tesf,AP mf’df b,u.t‘t.fn.‘ k) the Envoy phone icon flashes green, it means WPS
e pairing has been initiated, which we

do not want at this time. Please wait

O @& for the WPS pairing to timeout in two
o P minutes and then repeat step 1.
|
o
Step 3b: Turn © Turn off mobile data
Off mOb“e data. rn off the maobile data (cellular data) from your

quigqte to your mobile device settings. Go to Settings > Mobile Data
phone settings neshton

without closing the

Enlighten App. Turn

off the mobile data I «—
(cellular data) from
your mobile device
by going to Settings
> Mobile Data and
switching it off.
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ol Airtel = 5:32 PM @ 0 43% = )
e Join Envoy’s network

B ) - £ Settings Wi-Fi
Join the Envoy's network using your phone Wi-F
setting I
netwo
digi .
Wi-Fi C @)
RUNLABLE NETHORKS v CodeCraft_HandHeld 8 =
8 T
ENVOY_029655 a T e CHOOSE A NETWORK... =,
Lt CodeCraft a = (
codecraft airtel 8 7= ()
codecraft airtel_EXT a = (i
Step 3c: Joi '
ePp SC: Join Envoy's
CodeCraft-Main 8 =0

network using your phone’s
Wi-Fi settings. Navigate to ENVOY.029655 = @
the Wi-Fi settings and look
for the Envoy’'s wireless

network. The network name Huconsolution L)
will include the last six

Hucon Airtel & = (i

.. . Susmitha's Mac-mini a = (
digits of your Envoy’s serial
number. In this example: dema-DTS 8= ®
Envoy_029655 is the name Terra-U2-2F am D

of the network.

Step 3d: After you have joined the Envoy’s network, return to
the Enlighten App’s “Reconnect to Envoy” screen. Scroll down to
see the “Configure home Wi-Fi” option and tap onit.

° Connect Envoy to home Wi-Fi Note: The “Configure
Home Wi-Fi” box may

Tap the configure Home Wi-Fi button, select your appear grey initially.
home network and enter the Wi-Fi password. Wait for few seconds

and when it turns blue,

taponit.
Configure home Wi-Fi
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Connect Envoy to Home Wi-Fi

Home_Wifi_Name 1 FES
Xiaomi_91BF é -

Home_Wifi_name .

Cancel

Step 4: on the
pop-up that appears,
select your home
network from the list of
available networks.

aill Aitel = % 100% )

Envoy is connected to Wi-Fi successfully.

You may now disconnect your mobile device from
your Envoy network and connect it to your Wi-Fi /
enable your mobile data.

Step 7: once the
connection is
established you will
see a message “Envoy
is connected to Wi-Fi
successfully”. You may
now connect your
mobile device to your
Wi-Fi or enable your
mobile data.

Enter password for
“Home_Wifi_Name 1"

=

Cancel Connect

Step B: Enter your
Wi-Fi password and
tap on Connect.

wll Airtel =

£ Notices

(@ YourEnvoy s connected successfuly. But it may take
upto 30 mins for the status of your Envoy to get updated.

Microinverters are not reporting data to the
Envoy.

Envoy is Not Reporting

-
o

We have found that your using Envoy -S or
1Q Envoy and using Wi-Fi.

Get Help

z

nu

Step 8: Tap on “OK,
got it”. Your envoy has
been successfully
connected to your
Wi-Fi network. You
may still see “Envoy is
Not Reporting” status
under “Notices”. Please
note it may take up to
30 minutes for the
status to get updated.

Connecting to Wi-Fi

This may take faw mins

Cancel

Step 6: it may take
a few minutes to
establish the
connection between
the Envoy and the
Home Wi-Fi.

Why is my Envoy LED
still red and why don’t |
see my production data
even after my Envoy has
been reconnected to the
internet?

Don’t worry if you don’t see
your production data or the
top/left-most light of the
Envoy is red, even after
reconnecting your Envoy back
to the internet. It takes some
time for the backed-up data
to sync up with Enlighten.
Typically, it takes about 1 hour
for each day of your Envoy
being offline. For example, if
your Envoy was offline for 30
days your system should fully

sync up in about 30 hours.

SERVICE DEPARTMENT
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Reconnecting your Envoy S or IQ Envoy via manual setup

Step 1: enable Envoy AP mode.

Briefly press and release (do not hold) the AP mode button on your Envoy.
Doing this will enable AP Mode (access point mode) on your Envoy, creating a
wireless network you can join with your phone or laptop.

o
oy

=0) Press the AP mode button.
; \ Do not long press. Doing so will enable the WPS mode, which we
@®

don’t need. If you accidentally pressed the button for too long,
® < don’t worry. The WPS pairing will timeout in two minutes.

i o j) /
| g = (o) ~ ¢ (o
o O @ @ |
Envoy S or 1Q IQ Combiner

The AP mode LED (the second LED next to the phone icon) should light up solid
green to indicate your Envoy is currently in AP mode.

\ AP Mode LED

SERVICE DEPARTMENT
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Step 2: connect your phone/laptop to the Envoy.

Navigate into your phone’s or laptop’s Wi-Fi settings and connect to the Wi-Fi
network titled Envoy _XXXXXX, where “XXXXXX" is the last six digits of your
Envoy’s serial number.

Keep note of the last 6 digits (The “XXXXXX” part) of your Envoy’s serial
number. It will come in handy a bit further in this troubleshooting process.
Db 9 PNT J2@m64PVMEMA@D 6 © 3 NS .o %8 6:45PM

< Wi-Fi - |

Connected

2WIRE622

Saved, Secured

HOME-02C0-

d (\

xfinitywifi vidauri
Open Secured

HOME 02C0 5 HOI\/IE 02C0 5

Secured (\ ble) ed (WP

vidauri xfinitywifi

Secured * Open

Cisco_9623E02F HOME-804F

Now open a browser on your device (Chrome, Internet Explorer, Firefox, etc.),
and in the address bar, type in 172.30.1.1 (Don't forget the dots!).

11:39:48 990 O457%0

172.30.1.1 X [ :

Doing so will bring you to the Envoy Configuration page.

SERVICE DEPARTMENT
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Step 3: Forget the old Wi-Fi network.

If your system is currently not connected to any Wi-Fi network, you can skip
this and jump ahead to step 4.

On the Envoy Configuration page, tap on Wi-Fi in the Monitoring pane. When
prompted, provide the Envoy Username (envoy) and password (last six digits
of the Envoy'’s serial numberg.

0 @ 172.30.1.1/homef#overview
— ENPHASE Settings v

Metering

/\ Meters Not Enabled

Set up metering now

Monitoring

& Connected to Enlighten
Last Report: 11 Mar, 2020 4:45 PM Password

Cellular Cancel Signin

Ethernet >
Wi-Fi Active %

Diagnostic Tools ?

© @ or o &

Envoy o

1 2 3 5 [ % 1=
Serial Number q W e r t y U |
121903008648
Part Number a S d f g h j

800-00655-r04

Software Version O’ Z X C V b n m @
D5.0.19 (eae687)

Software Bulld Date 7123 @ . -
10 Jan, 2019 12:50 AM e
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On the Wi-Fi configuration page, select More Info > Click Forget this Network >
Click Forget. Doing this will disconnect the Envoy from any previously
connected Wi-Fi networks enabling it to be connected to a new network.

Y @ 172.30.1.1/homednetwork/w 0§ & @ 1723000 homefnetwork/w @) 3 @ 17230001/ homesnetwork/w ()

EMPHASE Sttt = EMPHASE Settings = Forget Wi-Fi Network "EEGUEST™?

= Wi-Fi [:'Dnﬁgumti.}n &=  Wi-Fi I:Dnﬂgur.gtinn This Erveoy will no longer use this netwark bo connect to
Enlighten.
Wi-Fi N rk

Mate: This may interrupt communications with the

Enmvary and require you b ne-connect.
d to EEGUEST - L 4 R

Enabled o - Cancel m

oy Is cunrently cperating as a wireless Access Point Fangel this Metwork

SHBet ARainer Matwor

Disable AF Mode

AP Mode Enabled

5 currendly operaling as a wineless Access Point

Disstile AR Mode

Step 4: connect the new Wi-Fi network. Tap the View Networks button,
then select your home network from the list of available networks.

wil Verizon & 5:30 PM 3 50% @ )

121813017025
& 172.30.1.1/home# [

Select Network Note: If your home Wi-Fi does
Available Networks not show up in the list, check
if the Envoy is in range of
your Home Wi-Fi network.

EN PHASE Settings v

Cartus_Wi-Fi
4 Wi-Fi Configuration

Enphase

Wi-Fi Network

Enphase_Guest

Select a wireless network for this Envoy to
use to connect to Enlighten.

ENVOY_077452
HotFut_2.4Ghz

View Networks Connect Other Network

AP Mode Enabled

This Envoy is currently operating as a
wireless Access Point (AP).
Time Remaining: 4 hours 24 mins

Disable AP Mode

(314) 218-2663 x 102 | Service@StraightUpSolar.com SUE] | g ht U p




F

wil Verizon & 5:31 PM 3 50% ) Envoy Sl'Q Envoy |Q Combiner
& @ 1723011 @

Enter the password for EEGuest.

Note: This may interrupt
communications with the Envoy and
require you to re-connect.

Enter the password for ~ Check if the connection was successful. If the top
your home network LED light against the cloud icon lights up solid
and tap Connect. green; Congratulations! You're back online.

Why is my Envoy LED still red and why don’t | see my production data even
after my Envoy has been reconnected to the internet?

Don’t worry if you don’t see your production data or the top/left-most light of the Envoy

is red, even after reconnecting your Envoy back to the internet. It takes some time for the
backed-up data to sync up with Enlighten. Typically, it takes about 1 hour for each day of your
Envoy being offline. For example, if your Envoy was offline for 30 days your system should
fully sync up in about 30 hours.

SERVICE DEPARTMENT
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